
City of Gahanna

BATCH 2105 PAYMENTS PROOF
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User:             2080jvanmeter
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Page      1

    CLERK: 2080jvanmeter        BATCH NUMBER: 2105
    BATCH PROCESSING DATE: 08/10/2023

    RECEIPT    YEAR BILL       TYPE CATEGORY             CUST #     NAME               PROPERTY ID                     TOTAL AMOUNT
        LINE  CHARGE DESCRIPTION         PRIN PAID              INT PAID              INT HELD
    -------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
    4936       2023 4936       MS   Misc Cash Receipts   Speed Way Towing                                                    500.00
        1     BZBA   BZBA APPEA             500.00                  0.00                  0.00
        REVENUE:
          10101000 4600                     500.00 DESC: overpayment, appeal filed by d                  
        CASH:
          9990     1000                     500.00 DESC: Speed Way Towing Appeal                         REF2: JV081023

            1     CHECK                     500.00 CHECK #: 0239                 MEMO: Speed Way Towing

TOTAL RECEIPTS:                        1
TOTAL PAYMENTS:                   500.00

TOTAL PRINCIPAL PAID:             500.00
TOTAL INTEREST PAID:                0.00
TOTAL INTEREST HELD:                0.00



City of Gahanna

BATCH 2105 PAYMENTS PROOF - SUMMARY
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    CLERK: 2080jvanmeter        BATCH NUMBER: 2105
    BATCH PROCESSING DATE: 08/10/2023

    CATEGORY             YEAR RECEIPTS   PRIN PAID           INT PAID
    Misc Cash Receipts   2023 1
        BZBA   BZBA APPEA                   500.00               0.00
                                            500.00               0.00

                   GRAND TOTALS             500.00               0.00
                   TOTAL PAID               500.00
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BATCH 2105 PAYMENTS PROOF - SUMMARY
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    CLERK: 2080jvanmeter        BATCH NUMBER: 2105
    BATCH PROCESSING DATE: 08/10/2023

    TENDER                        TOTAL
    TYPE       QTY               AMOUNT
    CHECK      1                 500.00

              TOTAL:             500.00



City of Gahanna

BATCH 2105 PAYMENTS PROOF - SUMMARY

Report generated: 08/10/2023 15:51
User:             2080jvanmeter
Program ID:       arbilinq
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    CLERK: 2080jvanmeter        BATCH NUMBER: 2105
    BATCH PROCESSING DATE: 08/10/2023

    RECEIPT    YEAR BILL       TYPE CATEGORY             CUST #     NAME               PROPERTY ID                  OVERPAYMENT AMT

                                                                  RECEIPTS             OVERPAYMENT TOTALS:                     0.00

                                                        **  END OF REPORT  **
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside the City of Gahanna. Do not click l inks or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

From:                                         Marissa Borschke <MBorschke@cbjlawyers.com>
Sent:                                           Thursday, August 10, 2023 4:28 PM
To:                                               Jeremy VanMeter
Subject:                                     FW: [EXTERNAL] Speed Way Towing Appeal Refund
 
Follow Up Flag:                      Follow up
Flag Status:                              Flagged
 

 
I confirm the situation described below. Thank you for your help.
 

Marissa R. Borschke
 
Associate

 
From: Jeremy VanMeter <jeremy.vanmeter@gahanna.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, August 10, 2023 4:09 PM
To: Marissa Borschke <MBorschke@cbjlawyers.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Speed Way Towing Appeal Refund
 
Hi Marissa,
 
I spoke with our Finance Department and explained the situation. If you could, please confirm as to the below:
 
In order to complete the filing for the Speed Way Towing appeal by the deadline, the check for $500 was accepted by the Clerk. The check had inadvertently been pre-printed using an incorrect BZBA appeal
hearing fee amount and a replacement check was not available at the time of filing. Therefore, a refund is requested on behalf of the client in the amount of the overpayment of $300 (reference check
#0239).
 
And just for awareness, the Finance Department will have to wait until the check is processed/cleared to be able to then issue a refund of the $300 overpayment.
 
Thank you,
 
JEREMY A. VANMETER

CLERK OF COUNCIL

Council Office 
he/him/his

 
CITY OF GAHANNA
200 S. Hamilton Rd. 
Gahanna, Ohio 43230 
Office: 614-342-4091
jeremy.vanmeter@gahanna.gov 
www.gahanna.gov

     
 
 

From: Marissa Borschke <MBorschke@cbjlawyers.com> 
Sent: Thursday, August 10, 2023 3:41 PM
To: Jeremy VanMeter <jeremy.vanmeter@gahanna.gov>
Subject: Speed Way Towing Appeal Refund
 

 
Hi Jeremy,
 
Thank you for your help today with filing the appeal for Speed Way Towing. Let me know what you need from me regarding the refund of $300.00 from the check that accompanied the appeal.
 
Thanks again,
 

Marissa R. Borschke
 
Associate
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