City of Gahanna
o " 200 South Hamilton
.‘J KT; ot Road
g f Si ¢ Gahanna, Ohio 43230
Ighature

Ordinance: ORD-0051-2022

File Number: ORD-0051-2022

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR AND DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC
SERVICE TO ENTER INTO CONTRACT WITH AMERICAN ROCK SALT COLLC
FOR ROAD SALT FOR THE 2022-2023 WINTER SEASON

WHEREAS, the Southwest Ohio Purchasers for Government (SWOP4G) invites members of the organization
(local governments and political subdivisions) to partner with them for the cooperative purchase of road salt each
winter season; and

WHEREAS, on July 14, 2022, bids for road salt for the 2022-2023 winter season were opened and reviewed; and

WHEREAS, the lowest and best bidder for Gahanna's road salt needs is American Rock Salt Co LLC, with a
bid price of $71.84 per ton plus a $0 per ton piling charge; and

WHEREAS, there are currently sufficient funds appropriated in the 2022 budget to pay for this contract.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GAHANNA, COUNTY OF
FRANKLIN, STATE OF OHIO:

Section 1. That the Mayor and Director of Public Service are hereby authorized to enter into contract with
AMERICAN ROCK SALT CO LLC, 5520 ROUTE 63, MT. MORRIS, NY 14510, for road salt purchases for the
2022-2023 winter season, with the Bid Tab attached hereto as EXHIBIT A, and made a part herein.

Section 2. That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect after passage by this Council and 30 days after
date of signature of approval by the Mayor.

At a meeting Z‘ the; City Council on September 19, 2022, a motion was made by ﬁm(/ , Sec-

onded by , that this Ordinance be Adopted. The vote was as follows:
Ms. Angelou, : Ms. Bowers : Ms. McGregor, : Ms. Padova, 7&@
Mr. Renner, Mr Schnetze I\V/eaver
Presidenf 7 Date
Steph “Rénner

Date ,?/747//%

Attest by

eremy A"VanMeter
Clerk of Council
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File Number: ORD-0051-2022

Approved by the Mayor Mm Date 4 i R s
@rie A. Jddwin u
Approved as to Form Date L
ond &K{
City Attorn
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SWOP4G 2022/2023 ROCK SALT BID 22-021SWOP4G TABULATION

Yellow Highlight designates "Low Bid"

EXHIBIT A

Lt Organizaton TotaTons| AMPRICANROCK | CARGIL | (oupyosnnnprars | MORTON SALTING.
= more or less
2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024
1 |Batavia Township 700 No Bid No Bid $104.76 NO BID $94.35 $101.35 $88.89 $95.56
2 |Bath Township 300 $83.16 $90.73 NO BID $97.74 $105.52 $112.52 No Bid No Bid
3 |Beavercreek Township 1,200 $86.81 $94.71 NO BID $101.49 $103.98 $110.98 No Bid No Bid
4 |Beavercreek, City of 6,000 $86.81 $94.71 NO BID $101.21 $103.98 $110.98 No Bid No Bid
5 |Bellbrook, City of 500 $87.55 $95.52 NO BID $106.35 $103.92 $110.92 No Bid No Bid
6 |Bexley, City of 100 $70.95 $77.41 NO BID $79.16 $79.96 $86.96 No Bid No Bid
7 |Blendon Township 400 $71.56 $78.07 NO BID $81.10 $78.18 $85.18 No Bid No Bid
8 |Blue Ash, City of 3,000 No Bid No Bid $101.62 NO BID $90.97 $97.97 No Bid No Bid
9 |Brookville, City of 300 $79.16 $86.36 NO BID NO BID $104.83 $111.83 No Bid No Bid
10 |Butler Township 500 $83.91 $91.55 NO BID NO BID $103.48 $110.48 No Bid No Bid
11 |Caesarscreek Township 300 | $73.98 $80.71 NO BID $107.18 $104.48 $111.48 No Bid No Bid
12 |Cardington, Village of 75 $82.06 $89.53 NO BID $96.08 $71.91 $78.91 No Bid No Bid
13 |Cedarville, Village of 175 $81.94 $89.40 NO BID $93.59 $105.52 $112.52 No Bid No Bid
14 [Central Ohio Transit Authority 600 $71.76 $78.29 NO BID $78.33 $79.68 $86.68 No Bid No Bid
15 |Clayton, City of 800 $83.52 $91.12 NO BID NO BID $103.83 $110.83 No Bid No Bid
16 |Clearcreek Township 2,200 $91.29 $99.60 $105.93 NO BID $96.95 $103.95 No Bid No Bid
17 |Clermont County Engineer’s Office 5,500 | NoBid No Bid $104.76 NO BID $92.55 $99.55 $89.07 $95.75
18 |Clinton Township 250 $71.31 $77.80 NO BID $78.33 $78.18 $85.18 No Bid No Bid
19 |Concord Township 750 | $72.86 $79.49 NO BID $89.42 $73.67 $80.67 No Bid No Bid
20 |Dayton Public Schools 300 $83.52 $91.12 NO BID NO BID $103.42 $110.42 No Bid No Bid
21 |Dayton, City of 9,000 $83.62 $91.23 NO BID NO BID $97.77 $104.77 No Bid No Bid
22 |Dublin, City of 2,000 $71.40 $77.90 NO BID $80.07 $75.68 $82.68 No Bid No Bid
23 |Englewood, City of 1,200 $83.86 $91.49 NO BID NO BID $93.47 $100.47 No Bid No Bid
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SWOP4G 2022/2023 ROCK SALT BID 22-021SWOP4G TABULATION
Yellow Highlight designates "Low Bid"

It?e:—l Organization 1%——111;[‘:[1% Al\é[fﬂcég EI(J)SK INC(SI?PROGIS;TED COMPASS MINERALS MORTON SALT INC.
_ more or less
2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 2023-2024
24 |Evendale, Village of 300 | NoBid No Bid $101.62 NO BID $92.31 $99.31 No Bid No Bid
25 |Fairborn, City of 1,600 $83.20 $90.77 NO BID $104.95 $105.52 $112.52 No Bid No Bid
26 |Farmersville, Village of 150 $83.91 $91.55 NO BID NO BID $103.35 $110.35 No Bid No Bid
27 |Gahanna, City of 2,800 $71.84 $78.38 NO BID $78.33 $77.46 $84.46 No Bid No Bid
28 [Genoa Township 400 S71.73 $78.26 NO BID $84.99 $76.14 $83.14 No Bid No Bid
29 |Germantown, City of 400 $84.83 $92.55 NO BID NO BID $103.45 $110.45 No Bid No Bid
30 |German Township 250 $83.46 $91.05 NO BID NO BID $103.45 $110.45 No Bid No Bid
31 |Gilead Township (Morrow County) 200 | $83.49 $91.09 NO BID $96.08 $71.09 $78.09 No Bid No Bid
32 |Glendale, Village of 200 No Bid No Bid $101.62 NO BID $93.31 $100.31 No Bid No Bid
33 |Goshen Township 600 | No Bid No Bid $104.76 NO BID $95.33 $102.33 No Bid No Bid
34 |Grandview Heights, City of 500 $71.32 $77.81 NO BID $79.30 $78.18 $85.18 No Bid No Bid
35 |Greene County Engineer 7,500 $83.20 $90.77 NO BID $95.80 $103.48 $110.48 No Bid No Bid
36 |Hamilton, City of +/_3?(33m No Bid No Bid $103.47 NO BID $90.66 $97.66 No Bid No Bid
37 |Harlem Township 300 | $72.39 $78.98 NO BID $84.99 $76.14 $83.14 No Bid No Bid
38 |Harrison Township 1,000 $83.25 $90.83 NO BID NO BID $103.48 $110.48 No Bid No Bid
39 |Hilliard, City of 1,500 $83.90 $91.53 NO BID NO BID $78.18 $85.18 No Bid No Bid
40 |Huber Heights, City of 3,000 $83.98 $91.62 NO BID NO BID $100.06 $107.06 No Bid No Bid
41 |Indian Hill, Village of 2,500 No Bid No Bid $101.62 NO BID $90.97 $97.97 No Bid No Bid
42 |Jackson Township 150 | $83.21 $90.78 NO BID NO BID $103.35 $110.35 No Bid No Bid
43 [Jamestown, Village of 80 $83.17 $90.74 NO BID NO BID $106.52 $113.52 No Bid No Bid
44  |Jefferson Township 500 | $83.28 $90.86 NO BID NO BID $104.77 $111.77 No Bid No Bid
45 |Kettering, City of 5,500 $83.80 $91.43 NO BID NO BID $98.77 $105.77 No Bid No Bid
46 |Mad River Local Schools 110 $83.73 BOIESS NO BID NO BID $105.06 $112.06 No Bid No Bid
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SWOP4G 2022/2023 ROCK SALT BID 22-021SWOP4G TABULATION
Yellow Highlight designates "Low Bid"

lem Organizaton Total Tons | AMERICANROCK | CARGIL | (o cqninprars | MORTON SALTING
— more or less
2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024

47 |Mason, City of 5,500 $91.22 $99.52 $105.93 NO BID $92.35 $99.35 No Bid No Bid
48 |Miami County Engineers Office 5,000 $78.84 $86.01 NO BID $111.61 $78.47 $85.47 No Bid No Bid
49 |Miami Township (Clermont County) 3,500 | NoBid No Bid $104.76 NO BID $90.97 $97.97 No Bid No Bid
50 |[Miami Township (Montgomery County) 3,000 $83.61 $91.22 NO BID NO BID $98.80 $105.80 No Bid No Bid
51 |Miamisburg, City of 3,500 $83.99 $91.63 NO BID NO BID $98.80 $105.80 No Bid No Bid
52 |Middletown, City of 4,500 No Bid No Bid $103.47 NO BID $93.33 $100.33 No Bid No Bid
53 [Milford, City of 700 | No Bid No Bid $104.76 NO BID $93.97 $100.97 No Bid No Bid
54 |Monroe, City of 2,500 No Bid No Bid $103.47 NO BID $94.33 $101.33 No Bid No Bid
55 |Montgomery County Engineer's Office 10,000 $83.22 $90.79 NO BID NO BID $98.48 $105.48 No Bid No Bid
56 |Montgomery County Parks 150 | $83.60 $91.21 NO BID NO BID $104.48 $111.48 No Bid No Bid
57 |Moraine, City of 800 $83.05 $90.61 NO BID NO BID $103.42 $110.42 No Bid No Bid
58 |Mount Gilead, Village 150 $72.68 $79.29 NO BID $96.08 $71.09 $78.09 No Bid No Bid
59 [New Carlisle, City of 300 | $77.11 $84.13 NO BID $94.97 $107.70 $114.70 No Bid No Bid
60 |New Jasper Township 400 | $83.17 $90.74 NO BID $96.37 $104.98 $111.98 No Bid No Bid
61 [Oakwood, City of 900 $83.98 $91.62 NO BID NO BID $102.77 $109.77 No Bid No Bid
62 |Obetz, City of 600 $71.46 $77.96 NO BID $79.44 $79.96 $86.96 No Bid No Bid
63 |Perry Township (Franklin County) 400 | $71.33 $77.82 NO BID $81.93 $77.17 $84.17 No Bid No Bid
64 |Pierce Township 1,000 No Bid No Bid $104.76 NO BID $92.47 $99.47 No Bid No Bid
65 |Piqua, City of 2,500 $80.32 $87.63 NO BID $113.70 $77.73 $84.73 No Bid No Bid
66 |Powell, City of 1,500 | $71.14 $77.61 NO BID $84.99 $77.17 $84.17 No Bid No Bid
67 |Riverside, City of 1,500 $83.17 $90.74 NO BID NO BID $103.56 $110.56 No Bid No Bid
68 |Sharonville, City of 1,500 No Bid No Bid $101.62 NO BID $91.31 $98.31 No Bid No Bid
69 |Sidney, City of 1,200 $79.33 $86.55 NO BID $108.84 $78.92 $85.92 No Bid No Bid
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SWOP4G 2022/2023 ROCK SALT BID 22-021SWOP4G TABULATION

Yellow Highlight designates "Low Bid"

Ilt\l%- Organization % Al\;fﬁcgoN ELO(?K INCOCQPROGI:XTED COMPASS MINERALS MORTON SALT INC.
— more or less
2022-2023 2023-2024 2022-2023 2023-2024 2022-2023 2023-2024 2022-2023 2023-2024
70 |St. Bernard, Village of 530 | NoBid | NoBid | $101.62 | NOBID | $91.54 $98.54 $86.51 $93.00
71 |Stonelick Township 300 | No Bid No Bid $104.76 NO BID $94.35 $101.35 $88.89 $95.56
72 |Sugarcreek Township 1,000 | $77.52 $84.57 | NOBID | $107.04 | $103.67 | $11067 | NoBid | NoBid
73 |Tate Township (Clermont County OH) 250| NoBid | NoBid | $10476 | NOBID | $9633 | $10333 | $90.08 $96.84
74 |Trenton, City of 500| NoBid | NoBid | $10347 | NOBID | $95.85 | $102.85 | NoBid | NoBid
75 |Trotwood, City of 2,000 |  $83.69 $91.31 | NOBID | NOBID | $10248 | $109.48 | NoBid | NoBid
76 |Troy, City of 300 | $79.23 $8644 | NOBID | $113.84 | $80.97 $87.97 | NoBid | NoBid
77 |Union Township Trustees 2,200 | $83.16 $90.73 $104.76 NO BID $90.97 $97.97 $86.98 $93.50
78 [Union, City of 600 | $75.60 $8248 | NOBID | NOBID | $9347 | $10047 | NoBid | NoBid
79 [Upper Arlington, City of 750 | $71.32 $77.81 | NOBID | $79.84 $79.96 $86.96 | NoBid | NoBid
80 |Vandalia, City of 2,000 | $83.82 $91.45 | NOBID | NOBID | $92.21 $99.21 NoBid | NoBid
81 gf;hmgton Township (Montgomery County 2,500 |  $83.91 $91.55 | NOBID | NOBID | $101.35 | $10835 | NoBid | NoBid
82 |Washington Township (Clermont County) 200 No Bid No Bid $104.76 NO BID $95.33 $102.33 $89.07 $95.75
83 |West Carrollton, City of 1,000 |  $83.75 $91.37 | NOBID | NOBID | $103.35 | $11035 | NoBid | NoBid
84 |West Jefferson, Village of 400 | $76.22 $83.16 | NOBID | $84.99 $83.46 $90.46 | NoBid | NoBid
85 |West Milton, Municipality of 300 | $79.23 $86.44 | NOBID | $106.75 | $82.71 $89.71 NoBid | NoBid
86 |Whitehall, City of 4,000 | $71.66 $78.18 | NOBID | $106.75 | $77.46 $84.46 | NoBid | NoBid
87 |Williamsburg Township 200| NoBid | NoBid | $10476 | NOBID | $9633 | $103.33 | $90.08 $96.84
88 |Woodlawn OH, Village of 300| NoBid | NoBid | $101.62 | NOBID | $92.31 $99.31 NoBid | NoBid
89 |Worthington, City of 1,500 | $71.32 $77.81 | NOBID | $79.72 $78.18 $85.18 | NoBid | NoBid
90 ;Zig?;l;a;egeo:eggpec I e 2,100 |  $87.62 $9559 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NoBid | NoBid
91 [Xenia, City of 1,500 | $85.98 $93.80 | NOBID | $95.66 | $103.98 | $11098 | NoBid | NoBid
92 [Xenia Township 800 | $83.23 $90.80 | NOBID | $97.06 | $103.98 | $11098 | NoBid | NoBid
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SWOP4G 2022/2023 ROCK SALT BID 22-021SWOP4G TABULATION

Yellow Highlight designates "Low Bid"

Estimated
Item .. e AMERICAN ROCK CARGIL
No. Organization Total Tons SALT CO. LLC INCORPORATED COMPASS MINERALS MORTON SALT INC.
i more or less
2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024 | 2022-2023 | 2023-2024
93 |Village of Yellow Springs 300 $84.13 $91.79 NO BID $93.86 $105.52 $112.52 No Bid No Bid
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